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August 8, 2024

Day Pitney's Ashley Picker Dubin Honored with 
Innovative Leadership Award by Corporate Counsel
Day Pitney Counsel Ashley Picker Dubin is being recognized with an Innovation Leadership Award as part of Corporate 
Counsel's 2024 Women, Influence and Power in Law (WIPL) Awards. Dubin counsels and advises clients in electronic 
discovery (eDiscovery) and information governance (IG) processes and best practices. The honorees will be recognized at 
an awards dinner on September 24 as part of the Women, Influence & Power in Law Conference in Chicago.

Dubin, who is based in Hartford, works with Day Pitney attorneys across multiple practice areas to tailor strategies and 
discovery management plans for U.S. matters for clients in the U.S., U.K., Europe, South America, and Asia. Dubin serves as 
eDiscovery liaison in jurisdictions across the United States, negotiates technology-assisted review (TAR) protocols, and 
litigates motions related to discovery disputes. Clients' in-house legal counsel, technology teams, and records management 
departments collaborate with Dubin to develop and implement best practices for discovery. She develops internal and 
external discovery guidelines addressing each phase of the Electronic Discovery Reference Model (EDRM), including 
innovative uses of AI. Clients frequently rely on her to negotiate discovery protocols with U.S. and state government 
agencies, U.S. Attorneys' offices, and private parties. Dubin is a member of ILTA, The Sedona Conference - WG1 and WG6, 
Women in eDiscovery, the American Bar Association, and the Connecticut Bar Association.

Dubin has been recognized on the 2024 Lawdragon 500 X – The Next Generation List (click here for the Lawdragon 
methodology). In 2023, she was named a Legal Innovator & Disrupter Honoree for the Connecticut Law Tribune's New 
England Legal Awards and is a Finalist in the same category for 2024 (click here for CLT's methodology). She was also 
selected as a Young Professional to Watch by the International Legal Technology Association (click here for ILTA's 
methodology). She earned her B.A. from Goucher College and her J.D. from New England School of Law. She is admitted to 
practice in Connecticut and Maryland.

According to Corporate Counsel, the WIPL awards recognize in-house and law firm women leaders and allies who have 
demonstrated a commitment to advancing the empowerment of women in law. For more information about the judging 
methodology, click here.

No aspect of this advertisement has been approved by the highest court of any state. Prior results do not guarantee a similar 
outcome.
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